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To: - BD/NCC/ECR' [EEEE@nctv.minjenv.nl]
512e] 5.1.2e

From:

Sent: Thur 3/25/2021 2:16:30 PM

Subject: RE: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands
Received: Thur 3/25/2021 2:16:30 PM

Grant Application Budget transport 1 Saint Martin.xlsx

Grant Application Budget transport 1 Curacao.xlsx

2 Grant Application Form transport 1 Vaccin Curacao.doc

2 Grant Application Form transport 1 Vaccin Saint Martin.doc
2 Grant Application Form transport 2 Vaccin Saint Martin.doc
2 Grant Application Form transport 3 Vaccin Curacao.doc
Grant Application Budget transport 2 Curacao.xIsx

2 Grant_Application Form transport 2 Vaccin Curacao.doc
Grant Application Budget transport 3 Curacao.xlsx

Slordig van me! Hierbij de gecorrigeerde formulieren!

Ik zal er op letten bij de volgende aanvragen.

Groetjes,

From: . -BD/NCC/ECR @nctv,minjenv.nb

Sent: donderdag 25 maart 2021 11:42
To: EXEE) I MK .t
Subject: FW: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands

Ha [EEE,

Zou jij hier naar willen kijken en de genoemde zaken aan kunnen passen? Dan stuur ik ze weer door. Volgens mij
gaat het enkel over het aanpassen van de naam van het eiland.

Hoor graag.

van JSERECN JEERERMl o <c curopa.cu>

Verzonden: dinsdag 23 maart 2021 16:13
Aan: ’ . - BD/NCC/ECR 4 @nctv.minjenv.nl>

cc: B[ - 8D/NCC/ECR < @nctv.minjenv.n>; [ CKION @ < curopa.cu

Onderwerp: RE: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands

Dear colleagues,

| already come back to you requesting some additional explanations, as | am preparing the grant while also waiting for feedback
about the other requested details. | noticed some inconsistencies in some of the grant application forms:

1. Transport by sea (08 to 18 February) to Saint Martin, according to the Grant application form — however, is this transport
related to Saint Martin or to Curagao? In the budget form we see the code for Curacao — can you please clarify or send us the
correct budget form?
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Type of | Supplier or Proveder
costn (0 @ Cencripton em type | Rema it | hemcosts | Totsd casts €
Trassport [Caaber infernabional [Shin ta « CUR exct 5oca costs 1 7826 10 1‘?‘|ﬂ
Logstcs JCavaber g foe ML CUR 1)
Other Cavaler intemabioal [GDP Fee NL-OUR 1
= 1)
L ocal costs QUR 1|
111150 MEWES IVOE £7 C0M18 MY BE AL FHSISAR IFRVRE ; st rasssen L Subtert LoGEES Uimer

2. Transport of vaccines to Curacao on 17/02 — in the grant application form we can still see a mention to Aruba in the line
dedicated to the affected country/region +in the budget form we can see one cost related to Aruba — we assume these are

typing mistakes, can you please correct?

Funding of transport and/or operations in the event of a major emergency to facilitate
a rapid and effective response thereto

1. Disaster/emergency and country aflected’ COVID-19 in Amuba_ Kingdom of the Netherlands

Uttimate beneficiary of the assistance: Mmstry of Health, Curagao

:ax ::, w(;lm Desoription Item type | kemsn | hemcosts | Total costs|
.00
Flight NL-CUR excl local costs 29,000.00]
Handting fee NL-CUR 45.00]
GOP fes NLAUA %
Securty
Local costs CUR 1" ,W;H
ool

3. Transport of vaccines to Saint Martin on 19/02 - in the grant application form we can still see a mention to Aruba in the
line dedicated to the affected country/region — can you please resend the corrected form?

4. Transport of vaccines to Curacao on 10/03 - in the grant application form we can still see a mention to Aruba in the line
dedicated to the affected country/region + in the budget form we can see one cost related to Aruba — can you please resend
the corrected forms? Also, | would have a question about the ETA — | see in the grant application form that this is 17/02 — |
assume it is a mistake, can you please also correct this?
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1 Disastes'omergency and country affected COVID-19 in Aruba. Kingdom of the Nethedands
Ultimate beneficlary of the assistance: Mzsuy of Heakh, Curagao

2 Typo of assistance for which EU co-inancing s requested
X Type of inkind assistance; Alr transpon
s Spoemanecus offer of a medule (specify module) NA
o Euwrepean Chil Protection Pool (ECPP) module (specily module) -
o rescEU capachies (specily capacity) -

3 EU cofinancing request for
X Ordy Transport
Opecations (including transpod)'

4. Expected period of assistance: (1 fare)

From: Amsterdam Schphol Azpont To! Hato Azpont, Curagao
Start 1000-2021
Fae 16032021 ETD 1030 AM  ETA 17022027 1530 pm flocal lime)

Celalled descrniplion of budget items

Type of |Supplior ae Provides ,
wosts (1) @ Bosouipmon Rem type | Rems | Mom oosts | Tetal sosnst

Fight NL-CUR excl. local Costs) 6,900,
(Handing fee NLLUR
[GoF fex NLAUA ¥
Secwty
Local costs CUR §,000.00
i
n

5. Transport of vaccines to Saint martin on 19/03 - in the grant application form we can still see a mention to Aruba in the
line dedicated to the affected country/region — can you please resend the corrected form?

6. Transport of vaccines to Curacao on 24/03 - in the grant application form we can still see a mention to Aruba in the line
dedicated to the affected country/region + in the budget form we can see one cost related to Aruba — can you please
correct?

Thank you for your feedback and for sending us the updated documents!

European Commission
Directorate-General for European Civil Protection and Humanitarian Aid Operations (ECHO)
ECHO.A - Emergency Management

A/1 - Emergency Response Coardination Centre (ERCC)

Rue de la Loi 86 | B-1049 Brussels, Belgium
+32 5.1.2e
ec.europa.eu
Websites: EN - FR | Blog | YouTube | Flickr | Twitter | Facebook | Instagram

- [

Sent: Tuesday, March 23, 2021 9:18 AM

- BD/NCC/ECR' nctv.minjenv.nl>
Cc: .. - BD/NCC/ECR nctv.minjenv.nl>; ECHO TRANSPORT COFINANCING <« 5.1.2e

@ ec.europa.eu>
Subject: RE: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands
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Thank you for your explanations!

In order to be very clear from the beginning, can you please let me know exactly who is signing the grant agreement and
who is the contact person (the grant agreement will be sent by email only so we would need to make sure it reaches the
right contact person! Several email addresses are of course even better!). The beneficiary will then be Ministerie van
Volksgezondheid, Welzijn en Sport and bank account should be IBAN/BIC/SWIFT code: NL55INGB0705003566 — can you
confirm? Also, we shall add the payment reference WBS element V190013/01BE.

Thank you for providing these details so that | can be sure that they are correct!

Also, | saw there are two additional requests (Aruba — flight on 23/03 and Curacao — flight on 24/03) — | will also add this to
the package and we will have a grant that includes 9 actions (SXNL1-9). | hope this is fine for you!!!

Regards,

European Commission
Directorate-General for European Civil Protection and Humanitarian Aid Operations (ECHO)
ECHO.A - Emergency Management

A/1 - Emergency Response Coordination Centre (ERCC)

Rue de la Loi 86 | B-1049 Brussels, Belgium
+3 I
€C.europa.eu

Websites: EN - FR | Blog | YouTube | Flickr | Twitter | Facebook | Instagram

From:, . - BD/NCC/ECR m@nctv.min'env.nb

Sent: Monday, March 22, 2021 8:20 PM
To: VILAU Livia (ECHO) ec.europa.eu>

Cc: , . - BD/NCC/ECR nctv.minjenv.nl>; , . I - BD/NCC/ECR <m@ nctv.minjenv.nl>

Subject: RE: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands

Sorry for the confusion. RIVM is part of our Ministry of Health (Ministerie van Volksgezondheid,
Welzijn en Sport), which is why one bank account can be used for all applications.

Please let me know if you need more information on this.

Kind regards,

National Crisis Center

Ministry of Justice and Security

address: Turfmarkt 147 / 2511 DP The Hague / The Netherdands / 7*" floor
Postal address: POB 16950 / 2500 BZ The Hague / The Netherlands
Mobile:

Email: nctv.minjenv.nl

Website: https://www.nctv.nl

Van: ec.europa.eu>

Verzonden: maandag 22 maart 2021 17:03

Aan: , . - BD/NCC/ECR m@nctv.minienv.nb; M, rivm.nl; NCC - NCTV

nctv.minjenv.nl>
CES ec.europa.eu




1274399

Onderwerp: RE: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands
Dear colleagues,

I am contacting you about the requests for co-financing concerning the assistance to the Caribbean islands.
Following our call mid-March in which you explained the modalities of transport for vaccines, | am now preparing
the grant agreement that would group the 7 requests we have so far. However, | would have some questions
about the beneficiary of this grant — in the first grant application form (SXNLO1-Saint Martin) the details concerning
the applicant are:

8. State/Organisation requesting co-financing: The Kingdom of The Netherlands, Ministry of Security and Justice,
National Coordinator of Counter Terrorism and Security, Directorate Security Regions and Civil Protection on behave
of the Ministry of Health of The Netherlands

9. Legal name of the applicant: Ministerie van Volksgezondheid, Welzijn en Sport

10. Legal registration number: N/A

11. Legal address:

Street Name and No: Parnassusplein 5 PO Box: 20350

Post Code: 2500 EJ Town/City: Den Haag
Country Code: NL Country Name: the Netherlands

Supportive Policy Officer (the Ministry of Health) Telephone: +31 6 46912347 E-
@mimnvs.nl

12. If the applicant’s Financial Identification Form for its current bank account has already been sent to the European
Commission:

13. Bank Name: ING Bank N.V.
IBAN/BIC/SWIFT code: NLS5INGB0705003566
or attach the applicant’s Financial Identification Form.

For the other requests the applicant details are the following:

8. State/Organisation requesting co-financing: The Kingdom of The Netherlands, Ministry of Security and Justice,
National Coordinator of Counter Terrorism and Security, Directorate Security Regions and Civil Protection on behave
of the Ministry of Health of The Netherlands

9. Legal name of the applicant: Ministerie van Volksgezondheid, Welzijn en Sport
10. Legal registration number: N/A
11. Legal address:

Street Name and No: Parnassusplein 5 PO Box: 20350

Post Code: 2500 EJ Town/City: Den Haag
Country Code: NL Country Name: the Netherlands

Contact person: , Rijksinstituut voor Volksgezondheid en Milieu (RIVM)

Dienst Vaccinvoorziening en Prev i ’s (DVP). Antonie van Lecuwenhoeklaan 9 | 3721 MA | Bilthoven |,
+31 30274 8524 | +31 6 3111560 mnvm.nl

12. If the applicant’s Financial Identification Form for its current bank account has already been sent to the European
Commission:

13. See Financial Identification Form. =
Please mention the following payment reference: WBS element V190013/01BE
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Indeed, the legal name of the applicant is the same (Ministerie van Volksgezondheid, Welzijn en Sport) — but | see
the contact persons belong to two different institutions: the Ministry of Health for the 1* request and the
Rijksinstituut voor Volksgezondheid en Milieu (RIVM). For the Rijksinstituut voor Volksgezondheid en Milieu
(RIVM), a Financial Identification form was also sent and the bank account is different than for the 1st request. If all
requests are grouped in one grant agreement, as we initially intended, there can only be one bank account. If not,
we would have to have separate grants.

Shall we understand that there are two different beneficiaries and hence we need to make two agreements? If this
is the case, please note that the Rijksinstituut voor Volksgezondheid en Milieu (RIVM) is not yet registered as a
separate beneficiary in our database and some documents will need to be provided: the Legal entity form and the
Declaration on Honor.

Can you please clarify exactly who the beneficiary is for the grant about Caribbean assistance?

Thank you!

European Commission
Directorate-General for European Civil Protection and Humanitarian Aid Operations (ECHO)
ECHO.A - Emergency Management

A/1 - Emergency Response Coordination Centre (ERCC)

Rue de |z Loi 86 | B-1049 Brussels, Belgium
+32 5.1.2e
ec.europa.eu
Websites: EN - FR | Blog | YouTube | Flickr | Twitter | Facebook | Instagram

From:, . - BD/NCC/ECR m@nctv.min'env.nb

Sent: Thursday, March 11, 2021 2:26 PM

TolEEES (=c+o) SRRl @ec.curopa.cu>

Subject: RE: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands

Thank you for your email. Would it be possible to make an appointment for tomorrow, I'll be in
the office early in the morning till 3:00PM

Kind regards,

National Crisis Center

Ministry of Justice and Security

address: Turfmarkt 147 / 2511 DP The Hague / The Netherlands / 7% floor
Postal address: POB 16950 / 2500 BZ The Hague / The Netherlands

Mobile: +3
Email: nctv.minjenv.nl

Website: https://www.nctv.nl

van: [ RN EE << curopa.cu>

Verzonden: donderdag 11 maart 2021 13:27

Aan: , . - BD/NCC/ECR m@ nctv.minjenv.nl>; NCC - NCTV nctv.minjenv.nl>

Onderwerp: RE: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands

Dear colleagues,
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| noticed that you tried to call me about this but unfortunately | didn’t manage to reply to your calls! |
listed to the voice message you left and maybe we can try to speak later this afternoon, after 16:00 - 16:30
maybe, if you are also available, as | have some meetings until then.

| could also try to call you myself, let me know when this would be possible!

Thank you!

European Commission
Directorate-General for European Civil Protection and Humanitarian Aid Operations (ECHO)
ECHO.A - Emergency Management

A/1 - Emergency Response Coordination Centre (ERCC)

Rue de la Loi 86 | B-1049 Brussels, Belgium

ec.europa.eu
Websites: EN - FR | Blog | YouTube | Flickr | Twitter | Facebook | Instagram

From: [IIEXEEIM (EcHO)
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2021 11:47 AM

To:@nctv.minjenv.nl' <
Cc: ECHO TRANSPORT COFINANCING «

@nctv.minjenv.nl>; BEEA@ nctv.minjenv.nl' m@nctv.min‘env.nb

5.1.2e @ec.europa.eu>; ADARVE Paloma (ECHO)
Dec.europa.eu>
Subject: Requests for co-financing to the Netherlands to support transport assistance to Caribbean islands

Dear colleagues,

| am contacting you with regards to assistance sent to the Caribbean islands (several requests
submitted to the ERCC), as we believe that this assistance represents only a small percentage of
the cargo used for each transport. This is not actually visible in the documents you submitted and if
this is confirmed by you, they would need to be amended. In such a case, the total cost in the grant
application form is only a fraction of the cost of the plane; therefore, you would need to revise
each grant application and add the following details:

- the percentage of the volume of the total cargo for the assistance sent
- the total cost of the plane

Could you please clarify and revise the grant application forms accordingly? Thank you very much
for your support.

Regards,

5.1.2e

European Commission
Directorate-General for European Civil Protection and Humanitarian Aid Operations (ECHO)

ECHO.A - Emergency Management
A/1 - Emergency Response Coordination Centre (ERCC)

Rue de |a Loi 86 | B-1049 Brussels, Belgium
+32 5.1.2e
ec.europa.eu
Websites: EN - FR | Blog | YouTube | Flickr | Twitter | Facebook | Instagram
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Dit bericht kan mnformatie bevatten die niet voor u 1s bestemd. Indien u niet de geadresseerde bent

of dit bericht abusievelijk aan u is toegezonden, wordt u verzocht dat aan de afzender te melden en
het bericht te verwijderen. De Staat aanvaardt geen aansprakelijkheid voor schade, van welke aard
ook, die verband houdt met risico's verbonden aan het elektronisch verzenden van berichten.

Miuisterie van Justitie en Veiligheid

This message may contain information that is not intended for you. If you are not the addressee or if this message was sent
to you by mistake, you are requested to inform the sender and delete the message. The State accepts
no liability for damage of any kind resulting from the risks inherent in the electronic transmission

of messages.

Ministry of Justice and Security

Dit bericht kan informatie bevatten die niet voor u is bestemd. Indien u niet de geadresseerde bent of dit
bericht abusievelijk aan u 1s toegezonden, wordt u verzocht dat aan de afzender te melden en het benicht te
verwijderen. De Staat aanvaardt geen aansprakelijkheid voor schade, van welke aard ook, die verband
houdt met nisico's verbonden aan het elektromisch verzenden van berichten.

Ministerie van Justitie en Veiligheid

This message may contain information that is not intended for you. If you are not the addressee or if this message was sent
to you by mistake, you are requested to inform the sender and delete the message. The State accepts no
liability for damage of any kind resulting from the risks inherent in the electronic transmission of

messages.

Ministry of Justice and Security

Dit bericht kan informatie bevatten die niet voor u is bestemd. Indien u niet de geadresseerde bent of dit bericht abusievelijk aan u
is toegezonden, wordt u verzocht dat aan de afzender te melden en het bericht te verwijderen. De Staat aanvaardt geen
aansprakelijkheid voor schade, van welke aard ook, die verband houdt met risico's verbonden aan het elektronisch verzenden van
berichten.

Ministerie van Justitie en Veiligheid
This message may contain information that is not intended for you. If you are not the addressee or if this message was sent to you
by mistake, you are requested to inform the sender and delete the message. The State accepts no liability for damage of any kind

resulting from the risks inherent in the electronic transmission of messages.

Ministry of Justice and Security



