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To: 5.1.2e 5512e 5.1.2e ERE @ rin.) EXECS, EXER) EGR EKER @ ives.
From: 5.1.2¢

| 4(5.1.2¢]

Sent: Mon 3/29/2021 11:31:51 AM

Subject: RE: Proposal

Received: Mon 3/29/2021 11:31:51 AM

Ok, zet ik deze zo door naar

5.1.2e

Crisisteam Caribisch Nederland

Programmadirectie Zorg en Jeugd Caribisch Nederland

Ministerie van Volksgezondheid, Welzijn en Sport

Parnassusplein 5 | Postbus 20350 | 2500 EJ | Den Haag

yei
PRE TT RFF Py 1 WET

E

IERERRC minvws.n)www.rijksoverheid.nl

Van: [JERR-ERE EER el) JEEM e@minvws.ni>
Verzonden: maandag 29 maart 2021 11:27

nan: ERE). (ERD) ERE is; EEE XIE. OE (HED) NEED irs >

Onderwerp: RE: Proposal

Prima zo. Ik hoop dat we een en ander helder hebben vandaag of morgen met cog op tekenen nieuwe contact voor 1 april.
GJ

Verzonden met BlackBerry Work

(www.blackberry.com)

Van: BEE3 E BE)JEN @minvws.ul>
Datum: maandag 29 mrt. 2021 11:07 AM

Onderwerp: RE: Proposal

Kleine aanvulling gedaan, verder lijkt me het volledig? Nog aanvullingen Gertjan?

5.1.2e

Crisisteam Caribisch Nederland

Programmadirectie Zorg en Jeugd Caribisch Nederland

Ministerie van Volksgezondheid, Welzijn en Sport

Parnassusplein 5 | Postbus 20350 | 2500 EJ | Den Haag

i i

E minvws.n

www.rijksoverheid.nl

Verzonden: maandag 29 maart 2021 10:48

Aan: IENEEICERETY) <BEXERM© minvws.n i>; EXER § (EER) EEE @minvws.ni>
Onderwerp: RE: Proposal

Zoiets?
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- Credit invoice april-august:

o discuss minor differences

o AMI makes overview of recruiting cost ICU MD’s Curacao, VWS is not willing to pay for ICU MD that didn't work,
but is however willing to reimburse actual costs involved.

- New contract:

o AMI makes a new proposal with uniform tariffs per position

o We discussed two options on PPE in the new contract: (1) discount tariff based on current market situation, (2)
AMI personell use PPE provided by the local hospital. AMI gives more details on PPE used and talks with the staff

and hospitals on the islands on the possibility of using PPE of the hospitals.

o Linda will send a proposal to be included in the contract

- Invoicing:

o With the new contract the invoices will be send weekly, with the discount incorporated in the tariff (not separate)

o AMI makes sure the weekrapports contain the information of the staff needed to be able to check the invoice by
VWS.

Met vriendelijke groet,

Programmadirectie Zorg en Jeugd Caribisch Nederland

Ministerie van Volksgezondheid, Welzijn en Sport

Parnassusplein 5 | Den Haag | Postbus 20350 | 2500 EJ | Den Haag

e IEE omnvsn)www.rijksoverheid.nl

5.1.2e k1R2e 5.1.2e ) JEM @minvws.ni>
Verzonden: maandag 29 maart 2021 10:30

Aan: EXER§. (EERD)ESEXN@ minvws.n >; EXER], EXER). BER (ERED) <HECKER© minvws.ni>
Onderwerp: FW: Proposal

iA size |
Hebben we al iets teruggehad? Volgens mij
wachten we nu op een inzicht in de kosten CUR, toch? En wij moeten bepalen wat voor korting wij willen op de PBMs.

Moeten we overigens niet een verslagje maken van ons gesprek van donderdag met de belangrijkste conclusies?

Groet,

GJ

Verzonden met BlackBerry Work

(www.blackberry.com)

van: [EXE

ICKEXN EECKECNIoan health>

ami.health>

Onderwerp: RE: Proposal
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Hi
5.1.2e

Thank you for sending. | will discuss these terms and conditions with my leadership and should we have any questions or require

any further clarification on the points that you have indicated below, we will be sure to reach back out.

Kind Regards,

ami
we'reEET) there 12030 Sunrise Valley Drive | Suite 250 | Reston, VA 20191

td ciasay [IEEE

Visit ami.health

fRVRO Rin

This email message is intended only for the addressee and may contain information which is confidential.

If you are not the intended recipient please advise the sender by return email, do not use or disclose the

contents, and delete the message and any attachments from your system.

Please consider the environment before printing this email.
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