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Thank you for the information.

Just to clarify, given your statistics, would you ask Pfizer to extend the period of 18/01-31/01, and if so, what would be a reasonable period
given your current situation?

Keeping in mind that Pfizer has so far indicated they would not make an exception if the period exceeds the month of January, we will be
discussing with them and will keep you updated on this point.

Thank iou in advance,

-----Original Message-—-—-
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@ec.europa. eu>:

51_29 : : 1. @ec.europa.eu>
(il 5.12e 512|512 5.1.2e ) @minvws.nl>
Subject: RE: BioNTech-Pfizer - Rebate Mechanism
Dear colleagues,
The Netherlands intends to use the rebate mechanism.
On average we are close to six doses per vial.

But it is not standard practice that everybody manages to get that result.

We appreciate efforts from Pfizer to help countries to extract six doses. But we keep finding it incorrect that we have to pay for something
that is not a certainty.

Best regards,
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Datum: dinsdag 23 feb. 2021 4:42 PM

Aan: BEE 5.1.2e 4 5i1i2e Dsm.ee< il @Smw
< 5.1.2e Msm.ee< 5.1.2e A X ; Ll ] @aemp
5.1.2e Maemps.es' < 5.1.2e
< 5.1.2e Amiz.hr< 5.1.2e iz. ] Al @thZ hr
p 5.1.2e @hziz.hr< 5.1.2e iz 5.1 i pt' <EFL@infarmed. pt@lnfarmed pt>>,
51.2¢ |s120 s & 5.1.2¢ [OINEMIEAR i
< 51.2e Daov.se< 5.1.2e
5.1.20 [ONITAIE: 5.1.2e
5.1.2e @minbuza.nl' < 5.1.2e @mlnbuza nI
B 5120 YRR 5.1.2¢ @DYov.Si>> @moh gov.c
5.1.2e @phs.moh.gov.cy 9 5.1.2e
5.1.2e @ formin .fi < 5.1.2e aformin.fig

5.1.2e @stm.fig 5.1.2e Dstm.fi>>, . @igf.finances.gouv.fr
51.2e @igf.finances.gouv.fr< 5.1.2e @igf.finances.gouv.fr>>, sg.social.gouv.fr
5.1.2e (@sg.social.gouv.frg 5.1.2e @sg.social.gouv.fr>>, @cabinets.finances.gouv.fr

5.1.2e @cabinets.finances.gouv.fr< 5.1.2e @cabinets.finances.gouv. fr>>, “@emmi.gov.hu

SRR @emmi.gov.hu< 5.1.2e @emmi.gov.hu>>, BEREEE@emmi.gov.hu
S @emmi.gov.hud 5.1.2e @emmi.gov.hu>>, [N @sanita. it @sanita.it S @sanita.it>>,



1154733

ms.etat.lu<

@ms.etat lu>>, IIIEEE@Ms ctat lu
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(@ec.europa.eus
@ec.europa.eu>>
Onderwerp: BioNTech-Pfizer - Rebate Mechanism
Dear Members of the Steering Board,

We took note of your intention to make use of the Rebate Mechanism, could you please confirm this is still the case?

5.1.2a

As for the other Member States could you please confirm that as of 1 February you have been able to exiract 6 doses.

Please note that Pfizer has so far indicated they would not make an exception if the period exceeds the month of January. However, we
need this information to assess the situation in the Member States.

Best regards,
EEETI @0 1CE57 14.5FBID620]
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