




FNAM President Alain Battisti told Le Figaro. At present, easyJet qualifies to have the
state pay a part of its France-based employees’ salaries — in spite of an “unfortunately
display of an inappropriate, even immoral, opportunism,” easyJet employees belonging to
the SNPL pilots’ union said last month.

IRELAND BACKS CORONAVIRUS VOUCHERS: Something else that Ryanair will
be cheering: Ireland has joined Dutch and German calls to amend EU air passenger rights
and package travel legislation as an emergency measure to allow travel companies and
airlines to keep hold of more cash.

In a letter from last week, Irish Transport Minister Shane Ross wrote to European
Transport Commission Adina Vălean arguing that the EU’s passenger rights rules “were
devised with cancellations affecting a single flight, airport, region or country in mind and
not with a pandemic that is now affecting every corner of the world.” Ross said only
vouchers ought to be offered, and only “after a period of months to be defined” can
passengers ask to be refunded.

It’s a position that the Socialist and Democrats and Renew Europe groups in the
Parliament have nominally backed, with caveats over how much time must go by before
passengers can apply for refunds.

Brussels’ move: All of that of course requires the Commission to actually propose
something. Brussels said early this month “the law is clear” that passengers can demand
refunds for canceled flights, but some countries decided to stop following that edict
unilaterally whilst pressuring Brussels to do something about it. The Commission said it
will issue “further clarifications” regarding passenger rights in lieu of airlines’ and travel
companies’ cash reserves.

HOW BAD IS THE CORONAVIRUS EFFECT? We crunched the numbers on flights
at Europe’s largest airports and in national airspace to map the impact so far.

This infographic is from POLITICO Pro’s DataPoint library. DataPoint provides ready-
to-use, customizable data presentation slides based on research by POLITICO journalists
and data analysts. Use them in your newsletters, presentations or on your website. To
access this DataPoint, and see what else we have in the library, email pro@politico.eu
requesting a complimentary trial.

Help save paper! Do you really need to print this email?

Dit bericht kan informatie bevatten die niet voor u is bestemd. Indien u niet de
geadresseerde bent of dit bericht abusievelijk aan u is toegezonden, wordt u verzocht dat
aan de afzender te melden en het bericht te verwijderen. De Staat aanvaardt geen
aansprakelijkheid voor schade, van welke aard ook, die verband houdt met risico's
verbonden aan het elektronisch verzenden van berichten.

This message may contain information that is not intended for you. If you are not the



addressee or if this message was sent to you by mistake, you are requested to inform the
sender and delete the message. The State accepts no liability for damage of any kind
resulting from the risks inherent in the electronic transmission of messages.
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